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Chairman Whitehouse, Co-Chairman Grassley, and members of the Senate Caucus on International 

Narcotics Control, thank you for inviting the National Institute on Drug Abuse (NIDA), a component of 

the National Institutes of Health (NIH), to participate in this hearing. Our mission at NIDA is to use 

science to address addiction in all its complexity, and I am glad for the opportunity to speak to you today 

�����}�µ�š���š�Z�������}�o�o�]�•�]�}�v���}�(���}�µ�Œ���v���š�]�}�v�[�•��addiction and overdose crises with the COVID-19 pandemic. 

 
Impact of the COVID-19 Pandemic on Drug Use and Overdose 
   
The twin addiction and overdose crises have collided with the COVID-19 pandemic, each exacerbating 
the deleterious effects of the other, resulting in increased rates of substance use and overdose, and 
increased risk for serious effects of COVID-19 illness. Large increases in many kinds of drug use and 
overdose have been recorded since March 2020, when a national emergency was declared and our lives 
radically changed due to lockdown and the closure of businesses and schools. Several reports have 
revealed increases in the number of positive urine drug screens for fentanyl, cocaine, heroin, and 
methamphetamine.1,2,3 There have also been increases in cannabis and alcohol use, especially among 
people with anxiety and depression and those experiencing COVID-19-related stress.4,5,6 Further, state 
and local data suggest substantial increases in emergency visits for drug overdose, including nonfatal 
overdose, despite a decline in overall non-COVID emergency department visits.7,8,9,10,11,12  
 

Provisional data from the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC) show that drug overdose 
deaths reached an estimated 93,000 deaths in 2020, a nearly 

https://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/millennium-healths-signals-report-covid-19-special-edition-reveals-significant-changes-in-drug-use-during-the-pandemic-301089684.html
https://www.prnewswire.com/news-releases/millennium-healths-signals-report-covid-19-special-edition-reveals-significant-changes-in-drug-use-during-the-pandemic-301089684.html
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2770987
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2770987
https://www.liebertpub.com/doi/full/10.1089/pop.2020.0230
https://www.liebertpub.com/doi/full/10.1089/pop.2020.0230
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC7763183/
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S0091743521000062?via%3Dihub
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/pii/S0091743521000062?via%3Dihub
https://www.jsad.com/doi/full/10.15288/jsad.2020.81.725
https://www.jsad.com/doi/full/10.15288/jsad.2020.81.725
https://injepijournal.biomedcentral.com/articles/10.1186/s40621-021-00322-0
https://injepijournal.biomedcentral.com/articles/10.1186/s40621-021-00322-0
https://injepijournal.biomedcentral.com/articles/10.1186/s40621-021-00322-0
https://injepijournal.biomedcentral.com/articles/10.1186/s40621-021-00322-0
https://onlinelibrary.wiley.com/doi/10.1111/ajad.13148
https://onlinelibrary.wiley.com/doi/10.1111/ajad.13148
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2770986
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2770986
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2770986
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/fullarticle/2770986
https://www.cdc.gov/injury/index.html
https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/nvss/vsrr/drug-overdose-data.htm
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and sustain recovery. Researchers have long recognized the strong correlation between stress and 
substance use, particularly in prompting relapse. Although exposure to stress is a common occurrence 

https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/covid19/pulse/mental-health.htm
https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/data/nhis/earlyrelease/ERmentalhealth-508.pdf
https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/data/nhis/earlyrelease/ERmentalhealth-508.pdf
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/abs/pii/S0091743520302553?via%3Dihub
https://www.sciencedirect.com/science/article/abs/pii/S0091743520302553?via%3Dihub
https://www.cdc.gov/mmwr/volumes/69/wr/mm6932a1.htm
https://www.cdc.gov/mmwr/volumes/69/wr/mm6932a1.htm
https://www.nature.com/articles/s41380-020-00880-7
https://www.nature.com/articles/s41380-020-00880-7
https://jkms.org/DOIx.php?id=10.3346/jkms.2020.35.e237
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC7799011/
https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC7799011/
https://ps.psychiatryonline.org/doi/10.1176/appi.ps.202000534
https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/10707430/#:~:text=Mechanisms%20of%20fatal%20opioid%20overdose.%20Opioids%20produce%20inhibition,are%20the%20major%20excitatory%20and%20inhibitory%20neurotransmitters%2C%20respectively.
https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/10707430/#:~:text=Mechanisms%20of%20fatal%20opioid%20overdose.%20Opioids%20produce%20inhibition,are%20the%20major%20excitatory%20and%20inhibitory%20neurotransmitters%2C%20respectively.
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the rapidity with which vaccines were developed, and skepticism about being at higher risk. 24 Vaccine 

https://www.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/pmc/articles/PMC7797771/
https://www.cdc.gov/coronavirus/2019-ncov/vaccines/safety/safety-of-vaccines.html/
https://www.kff.org/coronavirus-covid-19/issue-brief/impact-of-coronavirus-on-community-health-centers/
https://www.cdc.gov/healthequity/racism-disparities/index.html
https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/33556278/
https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/33556278/
https://pubmed.ncbi.nlm.nih.gov/32778445/
https://www.tandfonline.com/doi/pdf/10.1080/07418825.2012.761721?needAccess=true
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NIDA Research Addressing SUD and Overdose 
 
For the past nearly five decades, NIDA-supported research has led to the development of effective 
prevention and treatment interventions for SUD, providing hope for the more than 20 million people in 
the United States diagnosed with SUD and their loved ones. Although significant strides in establishing-
evidence-based practices have been made, there is far more work to be done to develop new 
prevention and treatment interventions and to implement existing effective interventions with fidelity, 
for diverse populations, and at scale. In particular, developing strategies to prevent and treat opioid and 
stimulant use, addiction, and overdose will continue to be key priorities for NIDA.  
 
Prevention 
Preventing the initiation of substance use and minimizing the risks of harmful consequences are 

essential components of addressing SUD. NIDA prevention research aims to understand and intervene 

upon risk and resilience mechanisms for addiction and common comorbidities. Under the Helping to End 

Addiction Long TermSM or HEAL InitiativeSM, NIDA leads prevention research aimed at adolescent and 

young adult populations that are at highest risk for opioid misuse and OUD.32 Goals of the program 

include preventing individuals with low-
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responded in real time to the COVID-19 pandemic with additional research to study COVID testing 
protocols in justice-involved populations. 
 
HEALing Communities Study 
The HEALing Communities Study, also part of the HEAL Initiative, is a multisite implementation research 
study investigating coordinated approaches for deploying evidence-based strategies to prevent and 
treat opioid misuse and OUD tailored to the needs of local communities. Research sites are partnering 
with 67 communities highly affected by the opioid crisis in four states to measure the impact of these 
efforts.34 The ambitious goal of the study is to reduce opioid-related overdose deaths by 40 percent over 
three years. Despite the impacts of COVID-19 on research, the HEALing Communities study was able to 
launch a key aspect of its program, a diverse communications campaign to increase awareness and 
demand for evidence-based practices and to reduce stigma against people with OUD and those taking 
medications for OUD.35  
 
Driving Solutions through Technological Innovation  
 
NIDA leverages 
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and other innovative products demonstrate that pairing sound science with biotechnology 
entrepreneurship has great potential benefit for our underserved patient population. 
 
NIDA Research on the Intersection of SUD and COVID-19 
 
In March 2020, NIDA responded to the urgent research need posed by the pandemic by issuing a Notice 
of Special Interest to solicit research at the intersection of COVID-�í�õ�����v�����•�µ���•�š���v�������µ�•���X���t���[�À�����(�µ�v��������
more than 100 supplemental research studies under this announcement, which was renewed this year. 
One of the areas of research NIDA is prioritizing is to understand how changes in healthcare policies 
implemented due to the pandemic, such as telehealth expansion and changes in the methadone take-
home dose policy, have affected addiction treatment access and outcomes. Recognizing that many 
people with SUDs do not have computers or smartphones, NIDA is also focusing on other innovative 
methods, such as combining telemedicine with street outreach to help ensure that all people receive the 
care they need. 
 
Through supplements to the HEALthy Brain and Child Development (HBCD) and Adolescent Brain 
Cognitive Development (ABCD) studies, we have been able to capitalize on existing infrastructure for 
longitudinal studies to examine the impact of COVID-19 on child development. HBCD, part of the HEAL 
Initiative, will add to our understanding of early brain development trajectories from the prenatal period 
through ages 9-10 by determining how environmental factors, including maternal drug exposure, 
substance use, and COVID-19 influence early brain development and clinical outcomes such as mental 
illnesses and addiction. ABCD is following nearly 12,000 children from age 9-10 through the subsequent 
decade, a period likely to capture the initiation of substance use behaviors. This study will determine 
how childhood experiences interact to affect brain development and social, behavioral, academic, and 
health outcomes, including substance use and COVID-19. Together, these studies will lead to a better 
understanding of typical brain and cognitive development and how they are affected by drugs and other 
environmental exposures.  
 
NIDA is also pleased to be participating in several of the large trans-NIH COVID-19 initiatives made 
possible with the generous support of Congress. For example, NIDA is participating in the Rapid 
Acceleration of Diagnostics Underserved Populations, or RADx-UP, Initiative, which aims to expand 
COVID-19 testing among underserved and medically and/or socially vulnerable populations; NIDA has 
ensured that people with SUD are recognized as one such population and are included in this research. 
We are also leading a program under the RADx-Radical initiative to accelerate methods for detecting 
SARS-CoV-2 in wastewater as a means of improving community-level surveillance of the virus. This 
project takes advantage of knowledge and expertise NIDA has developed through research on 
wastewater surveillance of drug use. 
 
Building Partnerships 
 
Partnerships are critical for NIDA research to make a positive impact on public health. �E�/�����[�•��
commitment to synergistic cooperation takes many different forms, designed to better respond to 
emergent issues or chronic needs in the public health arena. This includes working with a wide range of 
partners including state and local governments; sister agencies within the Department of Health and 
Human Services such as SAMHSA, FDA, and CDC; the Department of Justice; the White House Office on 
National Drug Control Policy (ONDCP); and with private industry.  
 




